
 

Newspaper columnist and minister George Crane tells of a wife 
who came into his office full of hatred toward her husband. "I do 
not only want to get rid of him, I want to get even. Before I di-
vorce him, I want to hurt him as much as he has me."  

Dr. Crane suggested an ingenious plan "Go home and act as if 
you really love your husband. Tell him how much he means to 
you. Praise him for every decent trait. Go out of your way to be 
as kind, considerate, and generous as possible. Spare no efforts 
to please him, to enjoy him. Make him believe you love him. After 
you've convinced him of your undying love and that you cannot 
live without him, then drop the bomb. Tell him that your're getting 
a divorce. That will really hurt him." With revenge in her eyes, 
she smiled and exclaimed, "Beautiful, beautiful. Will he ever be 
surprised!" And she did it with enthusiasm. Acting "as if." For two 
months she showed love, kindness, listening, giving, reinforcing, 
sharing. When she didn't return, Crane called. "Are you ready 
now to go through with the divorce?"   

"Divorce?" she exclaimed. "Never! I discovered I really do love 
him." Her actions had changed her feelings. Motion resulted in 
emotion. The ability to love is established not so much by fervent 
promise as often repeated deeds.  

Have a wonderful Sabbath! 

 

 

“Cornflakes and the Second Coming” 

2 Peter 3:3-4, 8-9  |  Elder Stephen Orian 

September 14, 2019 

THE WELL (Contemporary Worship) |   9:00 am 

BIBLE STUDY CLASSES                   |  10:00 am 

WORSHIP SERVICE (Blended)  |  11:00 am 

11:00 am Worship 
 

WE WORSHIP WITH SINGING 

Praise Team 
 

WELCOME 

Elder Jim Shepherd 
 

WE WORSHIP BY GIVING 

SAF Ministries and Outreach 
The offerings given this week are used to support the mission and outreach 

ministries of this church. Our ministries include community outreach, health 

awareness programs, youth and children’s ministries, Christian education, 

and more. Our goal each month is $8,064.00. Thank you for your faithful 

support of our mission. 

 

MUSIC FEATURE 
 

CHILDREN’S MESSAGE 

Marcus Mullins 
After the story, the children will come around collecting loose change offer-

ing. This offering is used to support the students of Springdale Adventist 

School. 

 

WE WORSHIP IN PRAYER 

Elder James Shepherd 
 

THE MESSAGE 

Elder Stephen Orian 

 



FELLOWSHIP LUNCHEON | Today 

You are invited to join us for our All-Church Potluck meal immedi-
ately following Second Service.   
 

ELDERS MEETING | September 16 

There will be an Elders meeting at 6:30p on September 16. 
 

PIE RECIPE CONTEST | September 21 

In efforts to find the perfect pumpkin, lemon meringue, apple, or 
pecan recipe. You will need to bring 2 pies and the recipe. Please 
pre-register with Jana Shepherd! Everyone attending will be judg-
es and taste the pies. Full details on bulletin board. We’ll be mak-
ing the winning recipes for a holiday pie fundraiser! Find those 
recipes and get baking! 
 

SPRINGDALE ADVENTIST SCHOOL | 2019-2020 

Springdale Adventist School offers kids an excellent opportunity to 
excel in learning in a Christian environment. The combination of 
interactive learning in the classroom and exciting off campus field 
trips gives these kids a leg up in their education.  You are invited 
to join us in championing Christian Education at Springdale Ad-
ventist School by sponsoring a child’s education. We have a num-
ber of students who need financial assistance to receive the best 
education possible. Your sponsorship guarantees he/she will re-
ceive the best education possible. If you would be interested in 
sponsoring a child, even in part, please contact Pastor Ben as 
soon as possible.  
 

QUIET BAGS | September 21 

The Deaconesses of SAF have been busy preparing quiet bags 
for children 10 and under. Starting next week you will be able to 
pick one up in the foyer. Be sure when church is over that you 
placed your used bag in the basket under the coat hangers in foy-
er. These bags are prepared out of love to help kids be able to 
have something to do during the sermon who are younger. 
  
OZARK ACADEMY | Juniors 

Please see flyer on bulletin about the Juniors of Ozark participat-
ing in the Heritage Tour. 
 

NOMINATION READINGS | Immediately 

1st Reading:  Cradle Roll/Kindergarten Teachers 

6:29p  “A Real Life Game of Thrones  

  Pastor by Appointment  

7:30a—3p SAS School Office Open 

6:30p  Elders Meeting 

  Pastor’s Day Off 

7:30a—3p SAS School Office Open 

 SAS Field Trip to Amazeum/School Office Closed 

10:00a—5p Pastor Available for Appointments 

6:30p  Mid-week Bible Study/Prayer Meeting 

6:30p  Pathfinders & Adventures 

10:00a—2p Pastor Available for Appointments 

7:30a—3p SAS School Office Open 

  Pastor’s Preparation Day 

8:00a  Pastor SAS Chapel 

7:30a—12p SAS School Office Open 

6:29p  “Jesus’ Plan to Save All His Children” 
7:29p  “At the End of Our Lives” 
7:16p  Sabbath Begins  

9:00a  “The Well” Service 

10:00a  Bible Study and Sabbath School 

11:00a  Worship Service  

6:29p  “90 MPG on the Highway to Hell” 

7:29p  “More Than Just a Survivor” 

7:15p  Sabbath Ends 
 

SUNDAY, SEPTEMBER 15 

MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 16 

TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 17 

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 18 

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 19 

FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 20 

 

September 21 Pastor Ben “Wishing We Could Live in Another 
    World” 

September 28 Pastor Ben “Living on the Edge of Night” 

SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 21 

Series Details 

• Friday, Sept 13, 6:29p:  “You’ve Only Got One life to live”  

• Saturday, Sept 14, 6:29p:  “Living Like Gilligan on Temptation 
      Island”  

• Saturday, Sept 14, 7:29p:  “Finding a Guiding Light in a Dark 

              World”  

• Sunday, Sept 15, 6:29p:  “A Real Life Game of Thrones” 

• Friday, Sept 20, 6:29p:  “Jesus’ Plan to Save Us All” 

• Friday, Sept 20, 7:29p:  “At the End of Our Lives” 

• Saturday, Sept 21, 6:29p:  “90 MPG on the Highway to Hell” 

• Saturday, Sept.21, 7:29p:  “More Than Just a Survivor” 

• Saturday, Sept, 28, 11:00a:  “Living On the Edge of Night” 

• Saturday, Sept 28, 6:29p:  “Building More Than a House of  

               Cards” 


